
Use of Facilities 
 
The following Hold Harmless Agreement shall be completed prior to use of facilities: 
 

To: CULVER CITY UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT 
 
In connection with the granted use of your tennis facilities and premises at Culver City High School, I, 
hereinafter referred to as the Permittee, do agree to defend, indemnify and hold harmless the Culver City 
Unified School District, hereinafter referred to as the District, its officers, agents and employees, individually 
and collectively, from and against all costs, losses, claims, demands, suits, actions, payments and judgements, 
including legal and attorney fees, arising from personal or bodily injuries, including death, or property damage 
or otherwise, however caused, sustained by any person(s), firm(s), corporations(s), including the District, 
brought or recovered against any of the above that may arise for any reason from or during or be alleged to be 
caused by the undersigned’s use/occupancy of District’s facilities, furniture or equipment or other use as 
requested by the Permittee, or from any occurrence in or on the demised premises, and will further indemnify 
and hold the District harmless against and from any and all claims arising from any breach or default on the 
part of the Permittee in the performance of any covenant or agreement on the part of the Permittee to be 
performed pursuant to the terms of this use, or arising from any act or negligence of the Permittee, or any of its 
agents, contractors, servants, employees, licensees, customers, or invitees.  In the case any action or 
proceeding is brought against the District by reason of such claim, the Permittee, upon notice from the District, 
covenants to resist or defend at Permittee expense such action or proceeding by counsel reasonably 
satisfactory to the District. 
 
The Permittee further agrees to retain responsibility for any loss, theft or damage to Permittee’s equipment, 
supplies or materials or equipment, supplies or materials of others brought onto or stored on District’s premises 
in connection with Permittee’s use of District’s facilities and premises. 
 
The Permittee further agrees and promises not to use or permit any other person, firm, or corporation to use 
pictures or films of the premises and/or facilities of the Culver City Unified School District in any movie film, film 
production or commercial venture the subject matter of which does or might bring discredit to the District, 
including any film production which contains immoral, obnoxious, obscene or injurious material, or is 
subversive in any way. 
 
The Permittee further agrees to surrender the premises and facilities to the District at termination of the use 
period hereinbefore specified in the same condition as at the commencement of the period.  The Permittee 
shall not remove any District property.  All equipment, supplies and materials of any kind, supplied and used by 
the Permittee, shall be removed from the premises at termination of the use period.  The Permittee shall be 
responsible for any damage to District property, arising from Permittee’s use, and shall promptly reimburse the 
District for repair or replacement as billed.  
 
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Permittee has executed this document on the            day of                     , 20  
 
 
Signature        
 
Name         

Address        

           

Telephone        

E-mail Address       


